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NOTICE TO ALL CONTRACTORS/SUPPLIERS 
 
1. All bids requested for in this bulletin are for the Mpumalanga Provincial Government, unless  
               otherwise stated. 
 
2. Adjudication of all bids will be in accordance with the PPPFA 
 
3. PERFORMANCE GUARANTEE REQUIREMENT 

 
The Mpumalanga Provincial Government has resolved to waive the requirement for a Performance Guarantee for all 
Projects/ Contracts for monetary values ranging from R0.1 up to R5.0 million. 
 

4. The requirement for an up-front payment of a Performance Guarantee shall remain applicable for Projects Construction 
Contracts whose monetary values exceed R5.0 million  
The following illustrates the above: 
Contract Value      % of Guarantee 
       Value required 
Over R5.0 million up to R6.0 million    6% 
Over R6.0 million up to R7.0 million    7% 
Over R 7.0 million up to R8.0 million    8% 
Over R8.0 million up to R9.0 million    9% 
From R9.01 million and above    10% 

 
5. RETENTION   

The Mpumalanga Provincial Government has further resolved that the deduction of retention monies from progress 
payments should remain in place as a security against any defaulters or in lieu of poor workmanship: 
 
5.1         BUILDING CONTRACTS IN GENERAL 

10% retention shall be deducted on any progress payment certificate, until the total deducted retention value      
equal 5% of total contract/ project value.  The money shall be released at the expiry date of the retention period, 
which is normally a three-month period. 
 

5.2         ENGINEERING CONTRACTS 
10 % retention shall be deducted on any progress payment certificate, until the total retention value equals 10% 
of the total contract/ project value.  5% of the retention money shall be released immediately after practical 
completion of the project, with the remaining 5% being released as soon as practically possible, depending on   
the nature of the project e.g. the construction of a bridge. 
 

6.             All provincial departments shall henceforth apply the above provisions. 
 
7. Submission of tenders: 

 
a) Bids must be on the official bid forms, which must be filled in and completed in all respects. 
b) Bids must be submitted in sealed envelopes. 
c) Separate envelopes must be used for each bid invitation. 
d) The bid number and closing date must appear on the front of the envelope. 
e) The name and address of the bidder must, however, appear on the back of the envelope only. 
f) Bid documents can also be obtained from the Satellite offices 
g) Unless otherwise stated, all bids close at 12h00. 

 
8.  APPLICATION FOR TAX CLEARANCE CERTIFICATE (IN RESPECT OF BIDS) 

 
IT IS A CONDITION OF BID THAT- 
The taxes of the successful bidder MUST be in order, or that suitable arrangement has been made with the South 
African Receiver of Revenue to satisfy them. 
The SBD.2 form, Application for Tax Clearance Certificate (in respect of bids), must be completed by the bidder in 
all aspects and submitted to the Receiver of Revenue where the bidder is registered for income tax purposes.  That 
the Receiver of Revenue will then furnish the bidder with a Tax Clearance Certificate that will be valid for 12 months 
from date of issue.  This Tax Clearance Certificate must be submitted with the original bid, before the closing time 
and date of the bid.  Failure to submit an original and valid Tax Clearance Certificate MAY invalidate your bid. 

 
Each party to a Consortium/ Sub-Contractor must complete a separate Tax Clearance Certificate.  Copies of the 
Application for Tax Clearance Certificate are attached to every bid document and may also be obtainable at any 
Receiver of Revenue’s Office 
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9. READING OUT OF BID PRICES 
 

Henceforth, only the prices of bids in the building, civil, mechanical and electrical works categories will be disclosed on 
request at the time of opening of bids. 
 

a) Tender submission results are read out to the public immediately after closure.   
b) No submission results will be faxed, emailed or made available telephonically by any of the Tender offices. 
c) Bidders can access this information also over the internet i.e http://treasury.mpg.gov.za   
d) Suppliers interested in the results, should arrange a representative or should attend the public reading directly 

after tender closures. 
e) Further note that due to the tender procedures required the names and bid offers will only be announced once; 

bidders who are late for the reading can unfortunately not be assisted with a second announcement. 
 

10.   LEVY 
 

Bidders are hereby advised that the Mpumalanga Provincial Government will only accept bank guaranteed cheque, cash 
or postal orders as payment for the bid levy.  Bidders are requested not to throw away their receipts for purchased bid 
documents.  NO EXCHANGES FOR CANCELLED OR WITHDRAWN TENDERS CAN BE MADE WITHOUT THE 
ORIGINAL RECEIPT 

 
11. The Mpumalanga Provincial Government requires of all bidders to provide details of their empowerment efforts and plans 

in the following key areas every time they submit bids: 
 

a) Directors/ Partners/ Members/ Owners 
 The number, role (executive/ non-executive) and influence (power) of Directors. 
b) Management 

The profile of the management structure, giving percentages of black participation across the levels (supervisor/ junior 
management/ middle management/ senior management).  The type of grading system used must be stated. 

c) Training and Development 
The Training and Development efforts must be stated – in the area of skills development for workers and management.  
The training expenditure as a percentage of payroll costs should be given. 

d) Joint Ventures 
The company must indicate any joint ventures it has with Blacks.  Specific details must be given to prove that such joint 
venture is genuine and real. 

e) Outsourcing 
The company must indicate which of its business activities (services/ goods) are provided by Black businesses. 

f) Sub-Contracting 
The company must indicate which part of the contract and for what value will be performed by a Black business out of the 
whole contract/ assignment it may secure value and benefit to communities. 

g) Equity Participation 
The bidder must provide information on the status of Black ownership in his/ her company. 

h) Other Empowerment Activities. 
The bidder would be free to supply other relevant empowerment details, which may not fall within the above-indicated 
framework. 

i) Industrial Relations Climate 
Sound Industrial Relations are a good measure not only to the extent of employee acceptance of the work-place 
environment, but also of the state of their empowerment.  If employees or their representatives are allowed and enabled to 
participate in key organizational processes, then a positive climate develops. 

 
This bulletin is issued by the Provincial Supply Chain Management offices, on behalf of Provincial Departments: 
Private Bag X11246   
Mbombela 1200   
 
(Please note that the above address is provided for general correspondence or applications to subscribe to receive this bulletin by 
post. It should not be used for submission of tender documents) 
 
Physical address: 
Visitors Centre 
Building no. 9 
Riverside Government Complex 
Bid Documentation Section 
 
For any enquiries, please contact: 
Ms.  TL Khathide 
Tel:   (013) 766 8259 / Fax: (013) 766 8455 

 

http://treasury.mpg.gov.za/
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Bid documents and other related bid/tender information are available from the 
following Supply Chain Management Offices:  
 
1. MBOMBELA 
       Riverside Government Complex 
       Building No 9, Government Boulevard, MBOMBELA, 1200 
       Telephone number: Mr. VS Ngobe (013) 766 6339 or Mr. FH Mkhondo (013) 766 6394 or Mr. J Sithole (013) 766 8258 or Ms  
TL Khathide (013) 766 8259 Fax number: (013) 766 8455 
 

2. MALELANE 
       The Provincial Treasury 
       24 air Street  
       Malelane 
       Contact Person: Mr. G Sibiya 079 695 1567 (number to be used during office hours only)  
       Fax No. : (013) 790 0514 
 

3.  SIYABUSWA 
Old Parliament Building, Building No.1, Job Skhosana Street, Siyabuswa, 0472 
Contact Person: Mr. Andries Mahlangu or Thabiso Molekwa     
Telephone number: (013) 973 0022/0106/0081 

 

4. MIDDELBURG 
  Department of Public Works 

       Cnr. Lillian Ngoyi and Dr Beyers Naudé Streets – Old TPA Building, Ground floor, Office numbers A5, A9  
       and 11 Contact Person: Ms. Lorraine Motebu or Ms. Mendy Kabini or Ms Linah Nethononda or Mr. KS Msiza or Ms. YM Bahula 
      Telephone number: (013) 282 8776 / 9151 
       Fax number: (013) 282 8776 
 

5. ELUKWATINI 
       Elukwatini Sub Regional offices  
      Office numbers A49 and A50 (opposite Elukwatini Community Hall) Stand number 12 Extension A, Elukwatini, 1190.  Contact  
      Person: Ms. P Nkosi: Telephone No: 017 883 1396/7 
 

6. PIET RETIEF 
      No. 11 Measroch Street, Piet Retief Office 
      Contact Person: Mr. Alex Shongwe 
      Telephone number: (017) 826 1671 
      Fax No: (017) 826 0577 

 
7. KWAMHLANGA 
       KwaMhlanga Government Complex 
      The Provincial Treasury, Building No. 12, Computer Centre 
      Contact Person: Ms. L Nethononda: 013 766 4872, Ms. E Mnguni: 013 766 4873,  
      Mr. MK Sibanyoni:   013 766 4900 or Mr. DE Mahlangu: 013 766 4875   
      Fax Number:  (013) 947 2250 
 
 

8. BUSHBUCKRIDGE 
       The Provincial Treasury, R40 Road, Bakoena Business Complex, Bushbuckridge                 
       Contact Person: Ms. Mapula Kgotsoka, Ms. Patricia Shikwambana and Mr. Peterson Sithole: Ms. PT Mashego 
       Telephone Numbers:  013 799 0229 / 2125 
       Fax: (013) 799 0535 
 

9.   SECUNDA  
       No 5 Van Eck Street, Secunda (opposite Sasol Value Gas Garage) 
       Contact Person: Ms. Martha Mahlangu or Ms. TV Manana or Ms. MJ Mavimbela or Mr M Mlombo  
       Telephone Number: (013) 766 1796 or 1794 or 1790 or 1795 or 1797 
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Please note that bid documents can be collected at any of the above-mentioned offices, and 
bid/tender documents can be submitted at the Supply Chain Offices listed below: 
Mbombela, Bushbuckridge, Malelane, KwaMhlanga, Middleburg, Siyabuswa, Secunda, Piet Retief and 
Elukwatini 

Bid Submissions: 
 
1.     TAKE CARE NOT TO SEND DOCUMENTS TO THE ADVERTISING DEPARTMENTS AS THE BID 

CLOSURES ARE NOT ADMINISTERED BY INDIVIDUAL DEPARTMENTS 
 
2. TENDER DOCUMENTS SHOULD BE SUBMITTED IN AS ORIGINAL AND NO COPIES WILL BE ACCEPTED.   
 
3.    ALL TENDERS AND PROPOSALS SHOULD BE DELIVERED OR COURIERED TO THE SUPPLY CHAIN 

OFFICES LISTED BELOW, BEFORE THE CLOSING DATE AND TIME. 
 

4.     THE ADDRESS OF THE TENDERER, TENDER NUMBER AND CLOSING DATE MUST APPEAR ON THE 
FRONT OF THE ENVELOPE – DO NOT SUBMIT DIFFERENT TENDERS IN ONE ENVELOPE 

 
5.     TENDER BOXES ARE LOCATED AT THE FOLLOWING CLOSING CENTRES:  

 
MBOMBELA 

Riverside Government Complex 
Building No 9, Government Boulevard, Mbombela, 1200 
Telephone number: Mr. VS Ngobe (013) 766 6339 or Mr. FH Mkhondo (013) 766 6394 or Mr. J Sithole (013) 766 8258 or 
Ms. TL Khathide (013) 766 8259 
 

PIET RETIEF       
 No. 11 Measroch Street, Piet Retief Office 
 Contact Person: Mr. Alex Shongwe:   Telephone number:   (017) 826 1671 

KWAMHLANGA 
KwaMhlanga Government Complex 
The Provincial Treasury, Building No. 12, Computer Centre 
Contact Person: Ms. Linah Nethononda: 013 766 4872, Ms. Emily Mnguni: 013 766 4873, 
Mr. MK Sibanyoni:   013 766 4900 or Mr. DE Mahlangu:  013 766 4875 
      
 

BUSHBUCKRIDGE 
The Provincial Treasury, R40 Road, Bakoena Business Complex, Bushbuckridge                 
Contact Person: Ms. Mapula Kgotsoka, Ms. Patricia Shikwambana and Mr. Peterson Sithole: Ms. PT Mashego 

           Telephone Numbers:  013 799 0229 / 2125 
 

MIDDELBURG 
 Department of Public Works 

Cnr. Lillian Ngoyi and Dr Beyers Naudé Streets – Old TPA Building, Ground floor, Office numbers A5, A9  
and 11 Contact Person: Ms. Lorraine Motebu or Ms. Mendy Kabini or Ms. Linah Nethononda or Mr. KS Msiza or Ms. YM 
Bahula Telephone number: (013) 282 8776 / 9151 

MALELANE 
 The Provincial Treasury 
         24 air Street 

Malelane 
Contact Person: Mr. G Sibiya : 079 695 1567 (number to be used during office hours only) 
Fax No. : (013) 790 0514 

ELUKWATINI 
Elukwatini Sub Regional offices Office numbers A49 and A50 (opposite Elukwatini Community Hall) Stand number 12 
Extension A, Elukwatini, 1190.  Contact Person: Ms. P Nkosi:      Telephone No: 017 883 1396/7 

SIYABUSWA 
Old Parliament Building, Building No.1, Job Skhosana Street, Siyabuswa, 0472 
Contact Person: Mr. Andries Mahlangu or Thabiso Molekwa     
Telephone number: (013) 973 0022/0081 

 

SECUNDA  
       No 5 Van Eck Street, Secunda (opposite Sasol Value Gas Garage) 
       Contact Person: Ms. Martha Mahlangu or Ms. TV Manana or Ms. MJ Mavimbela or Mr M Mlombo  
       Telephone Number: (013) 766 1796 or 1794 or 1790 or 1795 or 1797 



 
 

Mpumalanga Provincial Supply Chain Management Bid Bulletin/ Volume No. 354 23 January 2026 

 
  

7 

 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
  
   
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

  



 
 

Mpumalanga Provincial Supply Chain Management Bid Bulletin/ Volume No. 354 23 January 2026 

 
  

8  



 
 

Mpumalanga Provincial Supply Chain Management Bid Bulletin/ Volume No. 354 23 January 2026 

 
  

9 

 



 
 

Mpumalanga Provincial Supply Chain Management Bid Bulletin/ Volume No. 354 23 January 2026 

 
  

10 

 



 
 

Mpumalanga Provincial Supply Chain Management Bid Bulletin/ Volume No. 354 23 January 2026 

 
  

11 

 
 

 
 

NOTICE ON WITHDRAWN/CANCELLED BIDS 
 
1) Notice is hereby given to all bidders and stakeholders, that the following bids have 

been withdrawn/cancelled.  

2) Where determined, these bids will be re-advertised accordingly at the discretion 
of the relevant Government institution. Where these bids are re-advertised, it will 
be required of bidders to produce original receipts of the initial purchase in order 
to receive the relevant bid document in line with the re-advertisement. 

3) NB!!!!! No late bids will be accepted by Provincial Treasury 

 
 
WITHDRAWAL OF BIDS BY THE DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE, RURAL 
DEVELOPMENT, LAND & ENVIRONMENTAL AFFAIRS 
 
 

No BID NUMBER BID DESCRIPTION 

1. ALA/590/25/MP Panel of service providers for supply and delivery of protective 
clothing and uniform for a period of 36 months in the four Districts 
of Mpumalanga Province 

2. ALA/592/25/MP Call for proposals from potential investors to partner with the 
department of Agriculture, Rural Development, Land and 
Environmental Affairs to establish, manage and operate 
Agrivoltaics in selected Mpumalanga Agriculture & Agro-
Processing Farms & Facilities 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
                                             

 

WITHDRAWN/CANCELLED BIDS  
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BID NUMBER: ALA/590/26/MP Re-advertisement 

 

Description: 

PANEL OF SERVICE PROVIDERS FOR SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF 
PROTECTIVE CLOTHING AND UNIFORM FOR A PERIOD OF 36 MONTHS 

IN THE FOUR DISTRICTS OF MPUMALANGA PROVINCE  

Bid invited by: 
The Department of Agriculture, Rural Development, Land and Environmental 
Affairs 

Non-refundable fee: R150.00 payable in cash to the Mpumalanga Provincial Government 

Compulsory briefing 
session: 

Date: 05 February 2026 
Time: 10h00 

Venue: Nooitgedaght farm Ermelo 

Date: 04 February 2026 
Time: 10h00 

Venue: Kwa Mhlanga Government Complex  

Date: 05 February 2026 
Time: 10h00 

Venue: 101 Main Road Thulamahashe Bohlabela 
District Office 

Date: 06 February 2026 
Time: 10h00 

Venue: Riverside Office Park, Cycad Building Block 
4 , DARDLEA Ehlanzeni District Office 
 

Contact for  Bid enquiries, 
technical or specifications: 

Ms NI Mbuyane / Ms TV Dhludhlu :  013 766 6118 / 6674  
nimbuyane@mpg.gov.za    / tvmanana@mpg.gov.za    

Contact for availability of 
document: 

Provincial Supply Chain Management offices:   

013 766 6339, 6394 or 8269  or 8258 or 8259 
Where this document can 
be obtained: 

Any of the Mpumalanga Provincial Supply Chain offices: Refer to page 5 

Closing: Date: 20 February 2026 Time: 12h00 
Where this document must 
be submitted: 

Any of the nine regional branches, as specified on page 6 

 
 

BID NUMBER: ALA/592/26/MP Re-advertisement 

 

Description: 

CALL FOR PROPOSALS FROM POTENTIAL INVESTORS TO PARTNER 
WITH THE DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE, RURAL DEVELOPMENT, 
LAND AND ENVIRONMENTAL AFFAIRS TO ESTABLISH, MANAGE AND 

OPERATE AGRIVOLTAICS - IN SELECTED MPUMALANGA 
AGRICULTURE & AGRO-PROCESSING FARMS & FACILITIES  

Bid invited by: 
The Department of Agriculture, Rural Development, Land and Environmental 
Affairs 

Non-refundable fee: R150.00 payable in cash to the Mpumalanga Provincial Government 

Compulsory briefing 
session: 

Date: 06 February 2026 
Time: 12h00 

Venue: Riverside Office Park, Cycad Building Block 
4, DARDLEA Ehlanzeni District Office 

Contact for  Bid enquiries, 
technical or specifications: 

Eng J Jiyane (Pr Eng) / Ms NF Mafu  : 013 766 6153 / 072 654 8272    
injiyane@gmail.com 
Ms. NI Mbuyane / Ms. TV Dhludhlu :  013 766 6118 / 6674 
nimbuyane@mpg.gov.za  / vmanana@mpg.gov.za    

Contact for availability of 
document: 

Provincial Supply Chain Management offices:   

013 766 6339, 6394 or 8269  or 8258 or 8259 
Where this document can 
be obtained: 

Any of the Mpumalanga Provincial Supply Chain offices: Refer to page 5 

Closing: Date: 20 February 2026 Time: 12h00 
Where this document must 
be submitted: 

Any of the nine regional branches, as specified on page 6 

 

BID INVITATIONS 
 

mailto:nimbuyane@mpg.gov.za
mailto:tvmanana@mpg.gov.za
mailto:injiyane@gmail.com
mailto:nimbuyane@mpg.gov.za
mailto:vmanana@mpg.gov.za
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BID NUMBER: COGHSTA/017/26/MP  
 

Description: 

 APPOINTMENT OF TWO OR MORE SERVICE PROVIDER(S) FOR 
SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF STATIONERY FOR THE DEPARTMENT OF 

CO-OPERATIVE GOVERNANCE, HUMAN SETTLEMENTS & TRADITIONAL 
AFFAIRS FOR A PERIOD OF THREE (03) YEARS 

Bid invited by: 
The Department of Co-operative Governance, Human Settlements & Traditional 
Affairs 

Non-refundable fee: R150.00 payable in cash to the Mpumalanga Provincial Government 

Compulsory briefing 
session: 

Date: 04 February 2026 
Time: 10h00 

Venue: Valencia Community hall Mbombela 

Date: 05 February 2026 
Time: 11h00 

Venue: Nazareth Community hall Middleburg 

Date: 06 February 2026 
Time: 11h00 

Venue: Cassim Park Community Hall Ermelo 

Contact for  Bid enquiries, 
technical or specifications: 

Mr. D Mkhabela              : 013 766 6283    or mkhabelads@mpg.gov.za     
Ms. R.S Motsilanyana    : 013 766 6426 or rsmotsilanyana@mpg.gov.za             

Contact for availability of 
document: 

Provincial Supply Chain Management offices:   

013 766 6339, 6394 or 8269  or 8258 or 8259 
Where this document can 
be obtained: 

Any of the Mpumalanga Provincial Supply Chain offices: Refer to page 5 

Closing: Date: 16 February 2026 Time: 12h00 
Where this document must 
be submitted: 

Any of the nine regional branches, as specified on page 6 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

mailto:mkhabelads@mpg.gov.za
mailto:rsmotsilanyana@mpg.gov.za
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BID NUMBER: COGHSTA/018/26/MP  
 

Description: 

 APPOINTMENT OF TWO OR MORE SERVICE PROVIDER(S) FOR 
SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF TOILETRIES AND CLEANING MATERIALS 
FOR THE DEPARTMENT OF CO-OPERATIVE GOVERNANCE, HUMAN 

SETTLEMENTS & TRADITIONAL AFFAIRS FOR A PERIOD OF THREE (03) 
YEARS 

Bid invited by: 
The Department of Co-operative Governance, Human Settlements & Traditional 
Affairs 

Non-refundable fee: R150.00 payable in cash to the Mpumalanga Provincial Government 

Compulsory briefing 
session: 

Date: 04 February 2026 
Time: 12h00 

Venue: Valencia Community hall Mbombela 

Date: 05 February 2026 
Time: 13h00 

Venue: Nazareth Community hall Middleburg 

Date: 06 February 2026 
Time: 13h00 

Venue: Cassim Park Community Hall Ermelo 

Contact for  Bid enquiries, 
technical or specifications: 

Mr. D Mkhabela              : 013 766 6283    or mkhabelads@mpg.gov.za        
Ms. R.S Motsilanyana    : 013 766 6426 or rsmotsilanyana@mpg.gov.za             

Contact for availability of 
document: 

Provincial Supply Chain Management offices:   

013 766 6339, 6394 or 8269  or 8258 or 8259 
Where this document can 
be obtained: 

Any of the Mpumalanga Provincial Supply Chain offices: Refer to page 5 

Closing: Date: 16 February 2026 Time: 12h00 
Where this document must 
be submitted: 

Any of the nine regional branches, as specified on page 6 

 
 
 

 
 
 

 

BID NUMBER: EDU/133/26/MP  

Description: 

APPOINTMENT OF SERVICE PROVIDER(S) FOR THE 
PROVISIONING OF PRIVATE ACCOMMODATION FOR BOARDING 

FACILITIES, FOOD SUPPLY, LAUNDRY AND TRANSPORT 
SERVICES FOR DEAF LEARNERS ATTENDING AT BUKHOSIBETFU 

FULL SERVICE SCHOOL (FOR A PERIOD OF FIVE (5)  YEARS 
Bid invited by: The Department of Education 

Non-refundable fee: R150.00 payable in cash to the Mpumalanga Provincial Government 

Compulsory briefing 
session: 

Date: 02 February 2026 
Time: 10h00 

Venue: Siyaphambili building behind BMW, 
Nelspruit 

Contact for  Bid enquiries, 
technical or specifications:: 

Mr. J Mgiba                       : 013 766 5817   or J.Mgiba@mpuedu.gov.za   

Ms. GJ Lekhuleni             : 013 766 5163  or    G.Lekhuleni@mpuedu.gov.za  

Mr. QW Mbuyane              : 013 766 5287   or  Q.Mbuyane@mpuedu.gov.za 

Contact for availability of 
document: 

Provincial Supply Chain Management offices:   
013 766 6339, 8269  or 8258 or 6394 or 8259 

Where this document can 
be obtained: 

Any of the Mpumalanga Provincial Supply Chain offices: Refer to page 5 

Closing: Date: 18 February 2026 Time: 12h00 
Where this document must 
be submitted: 

Any of the nine regional branches, as specified on page 6 

mailto:mkhabelads@mpg.gov.za
mailto:rsmotsilanyana@mpg.gov.za
mailto:J.Mgiba@mpuedu.gov.za
mailto:G.Lekhuleni@mpuedu.gov.za
mailto:Q.Mbuyane@mpuedu.gov.za
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BID NUMBER: TREA/025/26/MP  

Description: 

APPOINTMENT OF A PANEL OF SOFTWARE DEVELOPERS FOR 
THE DEVELOPMENT OF DIGITAL SOLUTIONS FOR THE 

MPUMALANGA PROVINCIAL TREASURY FOR A PERIOD OF FIVE 
YEARS (60 MONTHS) 

Bid invited by: The Provincial Treasury 

Non-refundable fee: R150.00 payable in cash to the Mpumalanga Provincial Government 

Contact for  Bid enquiries, 
technical or specifications:: 

Mr. LJ Radebe                    : 013 766 4380  or LJRadebe@mpg.gov.za     
Ms. TC Cele                        :  013 766 4119  or   celetc@mpg.gov.za 

Contact for availability of 
document: 

Provincial Supply Chain Management offices:   
013 766 6339, 8269  or 8258 or 6394 or 8259 

Where this document can 
be obtained: 

Any of the Mpumalanga Provincial Supply Chain offices: Refer to page 5 

Closing: Date: 18 February 2026 Time: 12h00 
Where this document must 
be submitted: 

Any of the nine regional branches, as specified on page 6 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

BID NUMBER: EDU/035/26/MP  

Description: 

APPOINTMENT OF A SERVICE PROVIDER(S) TO SUPPLY AND 
DELIVER COOKING EQUIPMENT, EATING UTENSILS AS WELL AS 

GARDENING TOOLS TO SCHOOLS IN THE MPUMALANGA 
DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION FOR A PERIOD OF FIVE YEARS 

Bid invited by: The Department of Education 

Non-refundable fee: R150.00 payable in cash to the Mpumalanga Provincial Government 

Compulsory briefing 
session: 

Date: 03 February 2026 
Time: 10h00 

Venue: Siyaphambili building behind BMW, 
Nelspruit 

Contact for  Bid enquiries, 
technical or specifications:: 

Mr. S Maluleke                  : 013 766 5852   or S.Maluleke@mpuedu.gov.za   

Ms. GJ Lekhuleni             : 013 766 5163  or    G.Lekhuleni@mpuedu.gov.za  

Mr. QW Mbuyane              : 013 766 5287   or  Q.Mbuyane@mpuedu.gov.za 

Contact for availability of 
document: 

Provincial Supply Chain Management offices:   
013 766 6339, 8269  or 8258 or 6394 or 8259 

Where this document can 
be obtained: 

Any of the Mpumalanga Provincial Supply Chain offices: Refer to page 5 

Closing: Date: 18 February 2026 Time: 12h00 
Where this document must 
be submitted: 

Any of the nine regional branches, as specified on page 6 

mailto:LJRadebe@mpg.gov.za
mailto:S.Maluleke@mpuedu.gov.za
mailto:G.Lekhuleni@mpuedu.gov.za
mailto:Q.Mbuyane@mpuedu.gov.za
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BID NUMBER: NSEZ/2026/01  
 

DESCRIPTION OF 

REQUIREMENT 

APPOINTMENT OF A PANEL OF SERVICE PROVIDERS TO 

RENDER VARIOUS TRAININGS ALIGNED TO THE PROVINCIAL 

ECONOMIC SECTORS FOR A PERIOD OF 3 YEARS (36 MONTHS) 

BID NUMBER NSEZ/2026/01 

NAME OF INSTITUTION NKOMAZI SPECIAL ECONOMIC ZONE (NSEZ) 

PLACE WHERE GOODS, 

WORKS OR SERVICES ARE 

REQUIRED 

02 EASTERN BOULEVARD RIVERSIDE, MBOMBELA, 1200 

CLOSING DATE AND TIME OF 

BID 

DATE:  16 FEBRUARY 2026                           TIME: 12:00 PM  

 

CONTACT DETAILS 

 

 

PHYSICAL ADDRESS: 02 EASTERN BOULEVARD, RIVERSIDE, MBOMBELA 

 

POSTAL ADDRESS : PO BOX 1330 NELSPRUIT, 1200  

TELEPHONE NUMBERS: 013 492 5817/8 

E-MAIL ADDRESS: scm@nkomazisez.gov.za 

 

CONTACT PERSON (TECHNICAL ENQUIRIES): Ms. I Phiri 

E-MAIL ADDRESS: iphiri@nkomazisez.gov.za 

 

CONTACT PERSON (SCM ENQUIRIES): Mr. BN Mahlalela  

CONTACT NUMBER: 013 492 5818 

E-MAIL ADDRESS: scm@nkomazisez.gov.za 

COLLECTION OR ACCESSING THE 

BID DOCUMENT CA BE COLLECTED 

TENDER DOCUMENTS ARE FREE AND INTERESTED PARTIES MAY 

DOWNLOAD THEM FROM THE ETENDERS PUBLICATION. WHERE THERE ARE 

CHALLENGES WHEN DOWN LOADING THE TENDER DOCUMENTS, BIDDERS 

CAN REQUEST IT DIRECTLY FROM MEGA  WEBSITE: www.mega.gov.za  AND 

DIRECTLY FROM NSEZ www.nsez.co.za  

PLACE WHERE BID DOCUMENT 

MUST BE DELIVERED / DEPOSITED 

THE BID DOCUMENT TOGETHER SUPPORTING DOCUMENTS MUST BE 

SUBMITTED ON A SEALED ENVELOPE, MARKED:  

 

APPOINTMENT OF A PANEL OF SERVICE PROVIDERS TO RENDER VARIOUS 

TRAININGS ALIGNED TO THE PROVINCIAL ECONOMIC SECTORS FOR A 

PERIOD OF 3 YEARS (36 MONTHS) 

 

NAME OF SERVICE PROVIDER AND CLOSING DATE TO BE DEPOSITED INTO 

THE TENDER BOX LOCATED AT MEGA’S HEAD OFFICE: 02 EASTERN 

BOULEVARD, RIVERSIDE, MBOMBELA. 

 

ON OR BEFORE 16 FEBRUARY 2026 at 12:00 PM 

COMPULSORY BRIEFING 

SESSION/SITE VISIT 

NO COMPULSORY BRIEFING SESSION 

 
 
 
 
 
 

mailto:scm@nkomazisez.gov.za
mailto:scm@nkomazisez.gov.za
http://www.mega.gov.za/
http://www.nsez.co.za/
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ISSUING OF AN ADDENDUM FOR A BID BY THE DEPARTMENT OF ECONOMIC 
DEVELOPMENT AND TOURISM  

 
No Bid 

Bulletin 
Volume 
no 

Bid Number Bid Description Addendum accessibility 

1. 353 EDT/056/25/MP The appointment 
of a service 
provider for the 
provision of 
occupational 
hygiene services 
in the 
Department of 
Economic 
Developmente 
and Tourism for 
(Riverside 
Government 
Complex, 
Mbombela 
square and 
Emalahleni 
offices) 
for a period of 
thirty-six months 
36 months 

Addendum can be obtained 
on e-tender portal and all our 
SCM offices as reflected on 
pages 5 & 6 of this bulletin 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

ADDENDUM 
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EXTENSION OF VALIDITY PERIOD OF BIDS BY THE DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE, 
RURAL DEVELOPMENT, LAND & ENVIRONMENTAL AFFAIRS 
 

No. 
Description  

Bid No.  
Closing date of 

bid 
Validity Period Extension 

    Start date  End Date  

1. 

Panel of service 
providers for supply 
and delivery of 
protective clothing 
and uniform for a 
period of 36 months 
in the four districts 
of Mpumalanga 
Province 

ALA/590/25/MP 

  
 
 
 
15 July 2025 

13 December 
2025 

 
11 
January 
2026 

2. 

Electrification of 
Senteeko Tea 
Estate ALA/596/25/MP 

 
09 July 2025 07 December 

2025 

 
05 
January 
2026 

 
 
EXTENSION OF VALIDITY PERIOD FOR BIDS BY THE MPUMALANGA ECONOMIC 
GROWTH AGENCY  
 
 

No. Description Tender No. Closing Date 

for Bid 

Tender 

expiry date  

Tender 

validity date 

extended to 

1. Finalisation of township 
establishment 
processes at the 
Ekandustria Industrial 
Park 

MEGA/2026/05 01 October 
2025 

30 December 
2025 

28 February 
2026 

2. The appointment of a 
service provider for roof 
repairs at factories 75/1 
and 200/2, Ekandustria 
Industrial Park 

MEGA/2026/07 08 October 
2025 

06 January 
2026 

07 March 
2026 

 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

ANNEXURE A :EXTENSIONS OF VALIDITY PERIOD   
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AWARDED BIDS FOR THE DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE, RURAL DEVELOPMENT, 
LAND & ENVIRONMENTAL AFFAIRS 
 
 

No Bid no Bid Description Awarded bidders Amount 

1. ALA/595/25/MP Appointment for the 
rehabilitation on Phumlani 
village sewer system for 
Senteeko Tea Estate 

247 Khompho 
Trading Logistic CC 

R4 198 535.00 
 
  

2. ALA/596/25/MP Appointment for the 
electrification of Senteeko 
Tea Estate 

Prodipix 212 CC R43 835 762.91 

 
 
AWARDED BIDS FOR THE DEPARTMENT OF COOPERATIVE GOVERNANCE, HUMAN 
STTLEMENTS & TRADITIONAL AFFAIRS  

  
No Bid no Bid Description Awarded bidders Amount 

1. COGHSTA/001/25/MP Appointment of a service 
provider for the 
construction, paving, and 
installation of fencing of 
Kgarudi Traditional 
councils’ offices in Sanford 
Bushbuckridge Local 
Municipality Ehlanzeni 
District of the Mpumalanga 
Province 

TSBN Trading Jv Pri 
Glo Trading 

R7 578132.00 
 
  

2. COGHSTA/002/25/MP Appointment of a service 
provider for the 
construction, paving, and 
installation of fencing of 
Lekgoetla Traditional 
councils’ offices in 
Daggakraal within Dr 
Pixley ka Isaka Seme 
Local Municipality Gert 
Sibande District of the 
Mpumalanga Province 

Kgalo Holdings R8 569 112.35 

3. COGHSTA/003/25/MP Appointment of a service 
provider for the 
construction, paving, and 
installation of fencing of 
Esandleni traditional 
councils’ offices within 
albert luthuli local 
municipality gert sibande 
district of mpumalanga 
province 

K and L Designs and 
Construction 

R8 500 000.00 

 

AWARDED BIDS  
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4. COGHSTA/004/25/MP Appointment of a service 
provider for the installation 
of fencing and paving at 
Mashilane Traditional 
council offices in Thaba 
Chweu Local Municipality 
in Mpumalanga Province 

Double Hot Spot R2 230 974.24 

5. COGHSTA/005/25/MP Appointment of a service 
provider for the installation 
of fencing and paving at 
Sethlare Traditional council 
offices in Bushbuckridge 
Local Municipality in 
Mpumalanga Province 

Lalas 81 Trading R2 367 728.49 

6. COGHSTA/006/25/MP Appointment of a service 
provider for the installation 
of fencing and paving at 
Thabakgolo Traditional 
council offices in 
Bushbuckridge Local 
Municipality in 
Mpumalanga Province 

Zemangce Pty Ltd R2 300 000.00 

7. COGHSTA/007/25/MP Appointment of a service 
provider for the installation 
of parameter walls at the 
place of king Makhosonke 
ii, Engwenyameni, 
Klipfontein Thembisile 
Hani Local Municipality, 
Nkangala District, in 
Mpumalanga Province 

JT Isihlangu General 
Trading 

R7 578 132.00 

 
 
AWARDED BIDS FOR THE DEPARTMENT OF ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT AND TOURISM 
 
 

No Bid no Bid Description Awarded bidders Amount 

1. EDT/053/25/MP The appointment of a 
service provider to conduct 
a detailed feasibility study 
for a waterpark featuring 
waves in the Hazyview 
area situated at Mbombela 
Local Municipality in 
Mpumalanga Province 

Ngoti Development 
Consultants 

R1 675 890.00 
 
  

2. EDT/055/25/MP Appointment of a service 
provider for the review of 
the Mpumalanga 
Economic Growth and 
Development Path 
(MEGDP) 

Urban Econ 
Development 
Economics (Pty) Ltd 

R999 292.50 
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AWARDED BID FOR PROVINCIAL TREASURY  
 
 

No Bid no Bid Description Awarded 
bidder 

Amount Status 

1. TREA/021/25/MP Request for proposals: 
implementation and 
maintenance of an electronic 
leave management system 
(e-leave management) to the 
Mpumalanga Provincial 
Government for a period of 
60 months (5 years) with an 
option to extend 

Boxfusion Pty 
Ltd 

Rates 
 

Awarded
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NOTICE TO ALL PROSPECTIVE SUPPLIERS 
 
 
 Help Desk on 30 days payment 
 
It is law that all suppliers/service providers must be paid within 30 days after receipt of an 
invoice. In order to ensure compliance the Provincial Treasury is introducing a Help Desk to 
record complaints of non-payment of suppliers/service providers after invoices were 
submitted to departments, public entities and municipalities. Service providers must report 
the fact that they have not been paid after having submitted invoices to all government 
institutions. In order to lodge complaints the following should be done; 
 

- Send an e-mail to payme@mpg.gov.za indicating naming the institution where work 

was done, period work done, describing the type of work. You can as well e-mail a copy of 
the invoice. 
 
- Call toll free number 0800 0066 57. This is a government free number to report the non- 
payment of services done indicating the institution where work was done, period work done, 
describing the type of work. 
 
PLEASE NOTE THAT THE HELP DESK HAS BEEN OPERATIONAL FROM THE 01 July 
2016!!!!!!!!! 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

mailto:payme@mpg.gov.za
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General Notice to suppliers: 
 

DO NOT THROW AWAY RECEIPTS FOR TENDER DOCUMENTS.  
 

NO EXCHANGES FOR CANCELLED, WITHDRAWN or RE-ADVERTISED 
TENDERS CAN BE MADE WITHOUT THE ORIGINAL RECEIPT. 

 
APPLICABLE TARIFFS FOR 2024/25 FINANCIAL YEAR 

 
A) The subscription fee for a hard copy of the Provincial Tender Bulletin is charged at R45-00 

for local subscribers and R60-00 for subscribers based in other countries (VAT inclusive) 
per annum;  

B) The tariff charged for the sale of the Provincial Tender Bulletin at the counter is R10-00 
each (VAT inclusive); and 

  
PLEASE NOTE THAT OUR WEBSITE ADDRESS HAS CHANGED FOR VIEWING 
BULLETINS: http://treasury.mpg.gov.za  
 
 
 
 

 KINDLY NOTE THAT THE WEBSITE: https://etenders.treasury.gov.za  
 IS NOW AVAILABLE FOR DOWNLOADING OF BID DOCUMENTS. 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

http://treasury.mpg.gov.za/
https://etenders.treasury.gov.za/


 
 

Mpumalanga Provincial Supply Chain Management Bid Bulletin/ Volume No. 354 23 January 2026 

 
  

31 

 
 
  
 
 



 
 

Mpumalanga Provincial Supply Chain Management Bid Bulletin/ Volume No. 354 23 January 2026 

 
  

32 

 
 

 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
  

BUSINESS OPPORTUNITIES 

Information on available business opportunities and 
other business support services, particularly for the 
small business sector and Co-operatives, can be 
sought from the Enterprise Development Directorate, 
at the Department of Economic Development, 
Environment and Tourism. The contact details are as 
follows: 
 

Enterprise Development Directorate 
Department of Economic Development, 
Environment and Tourism 
Private Bag X11215 
Mbombela 
1200 

 

Telephone Numbers: (013) 766 4482 / 4443/ 
4803 / 4812 / 4813 or 4831 

REGISTRATION OF 

BUSINESS ENTITIES 
 

Companies and Intellectual Property 
Commission (CIPC) 
(A member of the Department of Trade and 
Industry) 
P.O. BOX 429 
Pretoria 
0001 

Telephone Number: (012) 394 9973 
Email: info@cipc.co.za 

REGISTRATION 

FOR VALUE 

ADDED TAX 

(VAT) 

 

 

 

Any Business Entity doing 
business with Government 
must register for Value Added 
Tax (VAT). 
Government will not do 
business with an entity that 
does not comply with this 
requirement. 
South African Revenue 
Services (SARS) 

 
Private Bag 11294 
Mbombela 
1200 

 

Telephone Number: 
(013) 759 4351 
 

 

 

Where to find support and information 
Business entities can seek assistance from institutions indicated  

 

below: 
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FUNDING 
 

MPUMALANGA ECONOMIC GROWTH 
AGENCY 
P O Box 5838 
Mbombela 
1200 
Telephone number: (013) 755 1731 
Or regional offices: (013) 752 6413 
Witbank: (013) 656 3231 
Secunda: (017) 634 8458 

 

 

NATIONAL YOUTH DEVELOPMENT 
AGENCY 
 
Shop no 8 Nedbank Centre 
30 Brown Street, Mbombela, 1200 
Telephone number: (013) 756 0100 
 
SMALL ENTERPRISE FINANCE AGENCY 
 
P O BOX 138  
MBOMBELA 
1200 

Mbombela Branch: 
Tel: (013) 755 2370 
 
NATIONAL EMPOWERMENT FUND 
13 Ferreira Street, Maxsa Building, 2nd floor, 
Nelspruit 1200 
Tel: (013) 754 9860 / 0861 633 678 
Fax: 0861 678 633 
Email mpumalanga@nefcorp.co.za 

CIDB  
 

For Construction and 
Industry Development 

Board (CIDB) grading and 
registration related 

enquiries, please contact 
the CIDB office on the 

numbers indicated below, or 
visit their website for more 

information: 
 
 

Mbombela Offices: 
086 1678 222 

 
Mbombela, 30 Brown Street 
Nedbank Building, 9th Floor 

(with Public Works) 
 

 
Pretoria Head Office: 

Tel: 012 482 7200 
Fax: 011 252 6944 

Fraudline: 0800 112432 
Registers Call Centre: 

0860 103 353 
 

Website: 
www.cidb.org.za 

http://www.cidb.org.za/
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THE ANTI-CORRUPTION 

TOLL FREE NUMBER: 

080 070 1701 
 

 


